
 

MIAMI, USA 

 

Latitude Longitude Altitude 

30°N 80°W 2m 

Description: 
Miami is a coastal city at Florida's southeastern tip. This glamorous 
city is famed for its colorful art deco buildings, white sand, surfside 
hotels and trendsetting nightclubs. 
 
 



 

MOGA, INDIA 

 

Latitude Longitude Altitude 

30°N 75°E 10m 

Description: 
Moga city is known for having several educational institutes. Moga is 
situated at the very northern end of India, near the border with 
Pakistan. Moga is far from the ocean. 

 



 

DINGBOCHE, NEPAL 

 

Latitude Longitude Altitude 

30°N 85°E 4400m 

Description: 
Dingboche is a small mountain town. The town was built as s 
stopping place for hikers about to climb Nepal’s highest mountains. 
Huge towering mountains surround the town. 



 

DURBAN, SOUTH AFRICA 

 
Latitude Longitude Altitude 

35°S 20°E 5m 

Description: 
Durban in the Zulu word for “bay”. It is a metropolitan city and is 
the second most important manufacturing hub in southern Africa. 
Durban is famous for being the busiest port in South Africa, but is 
also famous for it’s fantastic beaches. 
 



 

BULLOO DOWNS, AUSTRALIA 

 

Latitude Longitude Altitude 

35°S 145°E 10m 

Description: 
Bullo Downs is a town of fewer than 50 people. It was formed 
because it’s one of the few water holes in the middle of the 
enormous Australian desert. 

 



 

CHOS MALAL, ARGENTINA 

 

Latitude Longitude Altitude 

35°S 70°W 1000m 

Description: 
Chos Malal was founded in the late 1800s. The town was built to 
help stop bandits from stealing cattle. The town is situated on the 
slope of the Andes mountains far from the Pacific Ocean. 

 



 

ULLAPOOL, ENGLAND 

 

Latitude Longitude Altitude 

60°N 5°W 3m 

Description: 
Ullapool is a small coastal village in the north of England. While 
mountains surround the town, most of Ullapool is built right along 
the ocean waters. Ullapool is well known for its music and arts. 

 



 

PERM, RUSSIA 

 

Latitude Longitude Altitude 

60°N 55°E 100m 

Description: 
Perm is a medium sized city in the middle of Russia. While Perm is 
built on a river, it is very far away from the nearest ocean. Perm is 
mainly an industrial city that makes machinery and chemical 
products. 
 



 

WHITEHORSE, CANADA 

 

Latitude Longitude Altitude 

60°N 115°W 1000m 

Description: 
Whitehorse is small town in the Rocky Mountains of Canada. 
Whitehorse got its name from the nearby mountain rapids that look 
like the mane of a horse. Whitehorse is best known for three huge 
mountains that surround the town. 
 
 


